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 TECHNICAL DATA 
 

UPI PROTECTION BOARD-H 
 
 

 
1. DESCRIPTION 
 
UPI Protection Board-H is a heavy-duty asphalt 
impregnated organic mat with a fine mineral applied to the 
surface to prevent sticking in the roll. UPI Protection 
Board-H is very tough and provides positive protection to 
the waterproofing membrane during installation of other 
work. 
 
2.  TYPICAL USE 
 
UPI Protection Board-H is used as a protection course on 
horizontal surfaces to protect the waterproofing membrane 
from damage by foot traffic and physical abuse from other 
trades. 
 
Typical uses include plaza decks, roof terrace decks, 
parking decks and any other horizontal surface to which 
waterproofing membrane has been applied. 
 
3. PACKAGING 
 
Protection Board-H is 36” wide. It is supplied in rolls of 36 
feet in length (108 sq.ft per roll). The weight of each roll is 
approximately 70 lbs.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
4. STORAGE 
 
Store so as to prevent damage to the roll. Avoid prolonged 
exposure to direct sunlight. Protect from extreme 
environmental conditions. Store away from solvents, open 
flames or welding areas. 
 

5. LIMITED WARRANTY 
 
Urethane Polymers International, Inc. (UPI) warrants this 
product to be free of defects in workmanship and materials 
only at the time of shipment from our factory. If any UPI 
materials prove to contain manufacturing defects that 
substantially effect their performance, UPI will, at its 
option, replace the materials or refund its purchase price. 
 
This limited warranty is the only warranty extended by UPI 
with respect to its materials. There are no other warranties, 
including the implied warranties of merchantability and 
fitness for a particular purpose. UPI specifically disclaims 
liability for any incidental, consequential, or other 
damages, including but not limited to, loss of profits or 
damages to a structure or its contents, arising under any 
theory of law whatsoever. 
 
The dollar value of UPI’s liability and buyer’s remedy 
under this limited warranty shall not exceed the purchase 
price of the UPI material in question. 
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